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eScan Appoints
Mylo Inc as an
Exclusive
Business Partner
for Belgium

PRLog (Press Release) – Jun 30,
2012 – 
eScan expands its partner network
in Belgium.

Belgium, July 22, 2012: eScan, one
of the leading Anti-Virus and
Content Security Solution
providers announces the
expansion of its channel partner
network for SMB and Corporate
segments in Belgium through their
newly appointed partner Mylo
Inc., providers of ICT expertise,
solutions and services.

On this occasion, Mr. Govind
Rammurthy CEO and Managing
Director, eScan, said, “According
to Internet World Stats, April
2012, there were 8,489,901
internet users in Belgium
(representing 81.4% of the
population) in December 2011,
and this number is increasing day-
by-day. Looking at the current
scenario of IT cyber threats faced
by large networks, security is the
biggest challenge for them. These
ever-evolving security threats that
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are caused by insiders as well as
intruders severely affect business
operations, its profitability as well
as rapport with customers. eScan
range of advanced security
solutions are fit to fulfill the
security needs of networks in such
scenario. Our association with
Mylo Inc. is a step ahead, in
accordance to our expansion plans
in Belgium to make eScan, the
most preferred Anti-Virus
amongst the IT users in the
region.”

eScan range of security solutions
for large networks are well
equipped with eScan Management
Console (EMC) which comprises of
a secured web Interface that
facilitates dynamic security
management of the server and
endpoints in the network,
ensuring the network stay secured.
eScan security solutions are
designed not only to meet current,
but also the future business needs,
in order to ensure business growth
and continuity.

Talking about this exclusive
partnership for Belgium, Ms.
Shweta Thakare, AVP – Europe,
APAC & SAARC, eScan said, “The
latest version of eScan is designed
to meet the needs of small and
medium-sized businesses as well
as corporate. eScan is not only an
easy-to-use and cost-effective
network security management
solution, but is also designed
specifically to resolves issues
typically encountered by large
networks due to increasing cyber
attacks. It adapts to changing
network conditions and ensures
that businesses do not face any
disruption. Mylo Inc. has a wide
customer base in various segments
across the region; hence, with this
association we look forward to
attain a sizable market share in
SMB & Corporate sector in
Belgium.”

Sharing his thoughts on this
partnership with eScan, Mathias
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Buckinx, Managing Director, Mylo
Inc. bvba, said, “Our partnership
with eScan enabled us to bring a
whole new level of service into our
spectrum. Our missing link, it was
one thing to be associated with
business security services, but it is
so much better to be able to
deliver a product that does much
much more than its competitors
and at such an interesting
conditions. For us, this
partnership is what makes Mylo
complete.”

About eScan: 
eScan, one of the leading Anti-
Virus & Content Security solutions
for Desktops & Servers is
developed and marketed by
MicroWorld. It is powered by
innovative and futuristic
technologies, such as MWL
Technology, DIRC Technology,
NILP Technology, and
sophisticated Anti-Virus Heuristic
Algorithms that not only provides
protection from current threats,
but also provides proactive
protection against evolving threats.
eScan provides 24×7 free remote
support facility, integrated in the
software to help customers to get
their malware related issues
resolved in the fastest possible
time-frame. It has achieved
several certifications and awards
from some of the most prestigious
testing bodies, notable among
them being Virus Bulletin, AV-
Comparatives, West Coast Labs
(Checkmark), ICSA, and PCSL
labs. Combining the power of
various technologies, eScan
provides Multi-level Real-time
Protection to Computers and
Networks. For more information,
visit www.escanav.de or
www.escanav.com.

About Mylo Inc.:
Mylo Inc. was founded in 2007 by
Mathias Buckinx, after a career as
a full-time Business Information
and Communication Engineer and
Consultant. Mylo holds an
established position within the
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premium segment of ICT
consultants and specializes in the
field of infrastructure design,
system maintenance and support
services. Mylo Inc. is a Microsoft
Registered Partner and Microsoft
Small Business Specialist. In 2008,
Mathias Buckinx ITIL V3 certified,
the global standard in IT project
management and business process
analysis. Mylo is a Mensa
Managed company. It caters
services into three main segments:
ICT Consulting, Business Security
and Marketing Consulting. For
more information, visit
http://www.mylo.be/ .

Source Article from
http://www.prlog.org/11912986-
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